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gautama taught that the nature of reality is suffering,
and that the way to end suffering is to seek nirvana

(enlightenment), not just to live in accordance with the
four noble truths. he also taught that one should not
be attached to the worldly, that one should practise

"right view", and that one should purify the mind and
attain liberation from suffering. download policy:

content on the website is provided to you as is for your
information and personal use and may not be sold /
licensed / shared on other websites without getting

consent from its author. while downloading, if for some
reason you are not able to download a presentation,
the publisher may have deleted the file from their
server. download policy: content on the website is

provided to you as is for your information and personal
use and may not be sold / licensed / shared on other
websites without getting consent from its author. the

buddha was born in lumbini, india in about 560 bce. he
was the son of a rich business man who wanted to

marry his daughter to siddhartha, who was a middle-
aged man who had renounced all possessions. this

story is told in the sutta nipata, or the sayings of the
buddha, which is one of the major sources of the pali

canon. the buddha was a born a member of the
kshatriya caste, one of the most prominent of the

hindu caste system. he did not renounce his status as
a member of a higher caste; instead, he renounced
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the privileges of a member of that caste. his birth
father, ajatasattu, was a rich landowner, and his father
was a manager of an estate of the king, when he was

a boy. siddhartha grew up in a palace, and he had
every luxury available. his father had him learn the

vedas, the sacred texts of the vedic religion, and the
vedic religion was the religion of the king. the king was
a yajya kshatriya, a member of the warrior caste. the

power of the caste system is that it makes people
realize that they are of a higher caste than others. if
you are born into a lower caste, you are born with

disadvantages and no privileges. if you are born into a
higher caste, you have privileges, but you are still a
member of a caste. in siddhartha's case, his father
was at the top of the caste system, and siddhartha

was born into a royal family. he was born into a golden
age, in which the ruler ruled wisely and the people

lived in happiness. it was a time when people lived in
luxury, and the king reigned with justice, and the

people lived in peace.
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